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Birds of the Carolinas (1980) summarizes the recent expansion of the Cliff Swallow 
(Petrochelidon pyrrhonota) as a breeding species in the Carolina piedmont and coastal 
plain since it was first reported nesting at Hartwell Dam on the upper Savannah River in 
the spring of 1965. Its preference for dam sites, the dams serving as sheltered locations for 
the attachment of the swallows' characteristic mud nests, was also noted. No nesting 
activity has been reported for any of the larger dams or other suitable areas in the 
mountain region of either North Carolina or South Carolina. The discovery of a nesting 
pair of Cliff Swallows on 15 June 1981 on the Graham County side of the Fontana Dam 
by Owen McConnell and me represents the first evidence of the logical extension of 
breeding into the mountain region where suitable habitat exists. Accordingly, Stupka, in 
his Notes on the Birds of Great Smoky Mountains National Park (a park adjacent to 
Graham County and including the Swain County portion of Fontana Dam) recognized 
the Cliff Swallow only as a "very common fall migrant in the vicinity of the park." His 
studies were concluded in 1963, before the advent of the species as a breeder in the 
Carolinas. 

The Cliff Swallows were carefully observed while they were flying with Barn and 
Rough-winged Swallows in the vicinity of the dam. The pair had placed their jug-like 
mud nest under a concrete overhang at the top of the dam about 35 m from the shore and 
a few meters from the first flood gate. This nest was entirely separate from a colony of 
Barn Swallows occupying the flood gate openings on the opposite side of the dam. We 
watched the nest between 1400 and 1500 EDT, during which time both adults made 
frequent visits. An adult bird would arrive, on the average, once every 5 to 10 minutes. 
There seemed to be no synchronization between the two adults' visits to the nest. Some-
times they would arrive simultaneously, but at other times at well-spaced intervals. They 
stayed in the nest from 1 to 3 minutes, apparently feeding young. No evidence of addi-
tional pairs was found around the dam, and only time will tell whether the species will 
establish a colony here. 
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